2016 &1 fa9as G&=II$ 10

fearaa uvew Rue war sege ity SurEend a4
(Gaes) faeas, 2016

(R war # rwnfia w9 #)



feurad v fau= w1 semeE iR Surend daw

(dene=) fada®, 2016
QueEl @1 HH
Tvs:
1. Wigrg 79 |
2. URT 3 & GOEE |
3. URT 4 T GIOEA |

4. ORI 10— BT AAEH |



10

15

20

2016 &1 9T Aw=$ 10

feurae w2y faoma 9w aemE R Sursag dad
(Wete=) faekas, 2016

(e ¥ qrenfT w9 #H)

Rerae g A gur aeger 3k Suray Jaw AR, 1971
(1971 o1 SfRfEw dei® 4) @ AR RS FH B fog faEEs )

ARA TORISY @ Teucd a¥ # fRurae wew fAum w9 g™

fr=fafea 9 ¥ gz sff i ar—

1. =9 IR @ G 9 Ruaraa wew Rum ww ongy Wi
3R Surze Jau (FawE) AfRfm, 2016 | A |
)

2 fEumea gw fuma 991 segy iR SuRgd daq @ 3 &
affrE, 1971 (R =% S99 vwaq o AfRfATe H-l T B) Y weie
Ry 3 H—

(@) ST (1) ¥ U FWRT YR @ ORI R

W'W?@m@aﬁ?
(@) SourT (1-31) #; “d TR TR & W W “uEE
BAR &g W 9 |
3 Ho SRR & grt 4 ¥ g 4 @
() TR (1) 3, “FTRE EAR I B ¥ W TR
TAR” W @ TN 3R
(@) SwERT (1—3@) ¥, “fie FR” T B WFE W “gErE
BN U W AW |
4 Wa IR B awr 10-3 H- arT 10-%
W
(@) STuRT (1)3, = A TR B RIA W "a?mm I
g BN U ¥ Oe; 3R
(@) SR (2) ¥, “TW FOR’ YR D WH W wedE
BAY v T W0 |



Sewl IR RN &1 HAA

fRree wew e T @ wew gE—-gien a3 wel @ a9 3R
Gl ¥ Tl B A RieRe @ 8, ARy Wer @ forar man & qon et 5 98
B 31 R far Tar € | oG T, omaE A YU @ Y UHHudl a91Y 3@
3 fore ok e ww s w1 areaer 3R Surens B aaH AT, 1971 & Suewl B
feararel wew fRur W (Wewl @ wa AR Ueer) aftfaw, 1971 @ Suawil & SFTHY o
@ farg o A arge ok Suas @ A BN P 50,000/ —FIT | FGIH 80,000 / —HIY
e 3l 45,000/ —BY A TGN 75,000/ —FUY B B e Rear 74 B | WpR H
B AL 30,000 /—FIY W TSTHY 95,000 /—FU¢ A o1 4t RAfrewa o man 2| 39S
sfRew quer arn (91 Zifvre) gREn @ @ror SwTa @ sy @ g fewr @
BT 2,00,000 /—HIY A THE 2,50,000/ GG FA AN I IARF BN 10,000/ ~HY E
TITHT 25,000/ —HUQ B b1 o Rafemg fear man 8

7z fe Swfa SgewEl A gfd @ fag ® |

(@ RiE)
qERHA |



facia sro=

T @ wUe 2 § 4 @ aRfEiE BF R uwen A ufad am
24.96 @ w9 &7 AR amadt &g B |

IRG @ WRUM 3 T 207 @ IHM wswura B RwiRe

GhudiaRa o shovodo 0 (1)-5-3 /2016)

Reararet WY @ YouuTe, fRHTae W R wa aeger iR Suress dc (HeeE)
fagraa, 2016 ﬁ%ﬂ—m%ﬂﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬁﬂﬁﬁ%ﬂ,ma}m%m
207 & i, e @1 weg Ry w1 § Rt e ok 99 W fER e

Ry & & |



ﬁmmﬁmmmaammﬂ%ﬁ(mﬁm)m, 2016
femrae gaw R W onue iR SunmE dau SRPRE 1971 (1971 &I
ffron w=® 4) @1 ok e A @ fo faEas |

(e RE),
o= 7 |

(efo Ferea fE)
e e (@) |

[ R 2016



9 welgs fAdws gR W yaifdd 819 are fReed wew fdes e eue
3k SurenE Aow ARIFEE, 1971 (1971 &1 ARIFEw WETE 4) B SUEH] @
gG

HRIg:

3. JegE BT a9 AfE—(1) oy HRHE TEN F9R BUY B R F Ja9 AR
) Tt oy B SRy A @ Ry, Rare wie fum w (Feei 3 A 3R
) AR, 1971 B URT 4 B IU-4 (1) B @S (i) ¥ o1 RARfdE o w, Hwr
W HR BT §HAR el |

(1—af) areas R UiE BWR BYC @ IR ¥ GRIRS A1 W BRA BT FPIR
BRI |

(1 31—a7) e A TR T ARAN N R ¥ WeBR ¥ UK FXA BT §DAR
B |

(2) omnE P SHB! veTa B AN o WRHR &R Rt § Piges gafosa
g R S R SERET BT R U9 TRAR IET B | 0T AN T D
e 7 75 A AT W TE R QA S B ol 7 8 B e AW o
B g N T wD |

% XXX XXX XXX

4. SUTEDE $T A9 AfE—(1) Surmy sl Y F9R TOT B R W
e ol T et oty & R, we R @ frg, e e e i (el @
¥ AR ) SRFRM, 1971 B NI 4 B S9-uT (1) B @S (i) F v RfAfdE R
TR, el YT Y Bl FHAR BT |

'(1—m)mnmmmmma€rav\#uﬁmﬁﬂWWW%Ww
g |

(1—353) Iureas AR EWR BUY YR B I | PR T W TR BT FDAR
B |



: (2) SUrRHE B SHD! TEER B A ToU TRHR g e # PAgen gaferd
T8 a1 g e SReT 31 WA 50 WXAHR q89 B A7 SHS g ¥ 8 A
59 iy AW W o e T HET W) Iy WRBR Frra R, wew fhar ST | 359
WHR W WS SURZE 7 & B AN A TwE R W s P o a% TE 3
Fges Aferrf a5 = < " |

W oT.—Sunas e werg @ Ry afama wu ¥ T 9 B, afk Swe
frara & fog smEfea T8 @1 e v v @ v wug s | e 8 o 2

10—%. X g1 a1 ag, w1 gy Fges aran— (1) araer ok Surasr s
YeTafY & AR AU HgH B HY AT AT B IR I @IS 3N FER B g
SHD I AT B ATl el e @ e el A T e o Aof ¥ Yemnt gy O
AR ERT W B AR AT GEY AT B BT EDHEAR B IR a8 YA i af ¥
AHABTH Y TR T & i, T THR ST ARalds oA B ARG ST sHER VU
B TE YA B R B UG HYA W BT

W fawia af & Yemrt grr ar argant g™ @ 7 A @ e wdw ga w@n
3 9T HI W e wE Bl |

WS~ 56 SN 3 JAE @ Y 9 ‘ged A uR-ueh a9
Jfarfed awe g3 ik O wRa sfafRa soe g3 ok gt (g st B |

(2)  rme T SUTEE, IS ITRY W, T AR BN B U T9 FAR BUC @
IS i BT gHER B T YT Hew A, Ry af @ e ¥ of s
T2 smgem, o 9 8 W ool afdw, sud dow el W /A vagw il ¥ age e
S |

WD~ §9 TR & IRIT el WHH BT AGURY B B 77 Ewrere uer fer
T Iezer AR SUngE A ARfEE, 1971 B ORT 107 T7 REEe wSw Rum T
(el & A AR ) ARFEE, 1971 B GRT 6 B onfE, S Al 9 § Yot @

gt gRr @Y TS AT H g9 UPR SUTA YW B REE F o wem |



AUTHORITATIVE ENGLISH TEXT

Bill NO. 10 OF 2016

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT ) BILL, 2016

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)



THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2016

ARRANGEMENT OF CLAUSES
Clauses:
1. Shorttitle.
2. Amendmentofsection 3.
3. Amendment of section 4.
4. Amendment of section 10-A.



Bill No. 10 of 2016

THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2016

(AS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY)
A
BILL

Jfurther to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker 5 and Deputy
Speaker s Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of 1971).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of Himachal Pradesh in the
Sixty -seventh Year of the Republic of India as follow:—

1. This Act may be called the Himachal Pradesh Legislative short title.
Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries (Amendment) Act, 2016.

2. In section 3 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Afmezzi_m:r;l
O SCCLio] .
Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 (hereinafter referred to
" asthe “principal Act”).-

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “fifty thousand”, the
words “eighty thousand” shall be substituted.; and

10 (b) insub-section (1-AA), for the words “thirty thousand”,
the words “ninety five thousand” shall be substituted.

3. Insection4 of the principal Act,— Amendment

of section 4.

(@) insub-section (1), for the words “forty five thousand”, the
words “seventy five thousand” shall be substituted.; and



(b) insub-section (1-AA), for the words “thirty thousand”,
the words “ninety five thousand” shall be substituted.

A : 4 §ots %
Amand f.n::‘“ 4. Insection 10-A of the principal Act,
10-A.
(a) in sub-section (1), for the words “two lac rupees”, the
words “two lac fifty thousand rupees” shall be substituted;

and

/s

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words “ten thousand”, the words
“twenty five thousand” shall be substituted.



STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS

The Members Amenities Committee of the Himachal Pradesh Vidhan Sabha has
recommended to enhance the Salaries and other facilities to the Members which has been accepted
and has been decided to extend the same to them. Thus, in order to maintain the uniformity amongst
the Members, Speaker and Deputy Speaker and also to bring the provisions of the Himachal
Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’s Salaries Act, 1971 in conformity
with the provisions of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of
Members) Act, 1971, it has been decided to enhance the salary in respect of the Hon’ble
Speaker and Deputy Speaker from Rs. 50,000/~ to Rs. 80,000/~ and Rs. 45,000/~ to Rs. 75,000/
respectively. Ithas also been decided to enhance Sumptuary Allowance from Rs. 30,000/- to
Rs. 95,000/~ respectively. It has further been decided to enhance existing limit for reimbursement
of expenses incurred on account of free transit facility from Rs.2,00,000/-to Rs.2,50,000/-and
travelling advance from Rs. 10,000/- to Rs. 25 ,000/-.

This Bill seeks to achieve the aforesaid objectives.

(VIRBHADRA SINGH)
Chief Minister.

The ,2016.



FINANCIAL MEMORANDUM

Clauses 2 to 4 of the Bill, when enacted, will entail additional recurring expenditure out
of the State Exchequer to the tune of Rs. 24.96 lakhs per annum approximately.

MEMORANDUM REGARDING DELEGATED LEGISLATION

—Nil—

RECOMMENDATIONS OF THE GOVERNOR UNDER ARTICLE 207 OF
THE CONSTITUTION OF INDIA

(GAD File No. GAD-C- (D) 5-3/20 16)

The Governor of Himachal Pradesh, having been informed of the subject matter of the
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker’s and Deputy Speaker’ Salaries (Amendment)
Bill, 2016, recommends, under article 207 of the Constitution of India, the introduction and con-
sideration of the Bill in the State Legislative Assembly.



THE HIMACHAL PRADESH LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND
DEPUTY SPEAKER’S SALARIES (AMENDMENT) BILL, 2016

A

BILL

further to amend the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly Speaker s and Deputy
Speaker’ Salaries Act, 1971 (Act No. 4 of 1971).

(VIRBHADRA SINGH)
Chief Minister.

(DR. BALDEV SINGH)
Pr. Secretary (Law).

The ,2016.



EXTRACT OF THE PROVISIONS OF THE HIMACHAL
PRADESH LEGISLALTIVE ASSEMBLY SPEAKER’S AND DEPUTY
SPEAKER’S SALARIES ACT, 1971 (ACT NO. 4 OF1971) LIKELY
TO BE AFFECTED BY THIS AMENDMENT BILL

Sections:

3. Salary etc. of the Speaker.—(1) The Speaker shall be entitled to receive a salary at
the rate of fifty thousand rupees per mensem and an allowance for each day during the whole of
his term at the same rates as are specified in clause (ii) of sub-section (1) of section 4 of the
Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971 .

(1-A) The Speaker shall be entitled to receive compensatory allowance at the rate of
five thousand rupees per mensem.

(1-AA) The Speaker shall be entitled to receive sumptuary allowance at the rate of thirty
thousand rupees per mensem.

(2) The Speaker during the term of his office shall be provided by the State Government,
a free furnished house at Shimla, the maintenance charges of which shall be borne by the State
Govemment. The State Government may also allow him to continue in free occupation of the
house for a period not exceeding fifteen days from the date of his ceasing to be the Speaker.

4. Salary etc. of the Deputy Speaker.—(1) The Deputy Speaker shall be entitled to
receive a salary at the rate of forty five thousand rupees per mensem and an allowance for each
day during the whole of his term at the same rates as are specified in clause (ii) of sub-section (1)
of section 4 of the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members)
Act, 1971.

(1-A) The Deputy Speaker shall be entitled to receive compensatory allowance at the
rate of five thousand rupees per mensem. -

(1-AA) The Deputy Speaker shall be entitled to receive sumptuary allowance at the rate
of thirty thousand rupees per mensem.

(2) The Deputy Speaker during the term of his office shall be provided by the State
Government, a free fumished house at Shimla, the maintenance charges of which shall be borne by



the State Government or in lieu thereof he shall be paid such allowance not exceeding three hun-
dred rupees per mensem as the State Government may fix. The State Government may also allow
him 1o continue in free occupation of the house for period not exceeding fifteen days from the date
of his ceasing to be the Deputy Speaker.

Explanation,— The Deputy Speaker shall not become liable personally for any payment
in case the standard rent of the house allotted to him for residence exceeds one hundred and fifty

rupees per mensem.

10-A. Free transit by railway or by air—(1) Speaker and Deputy Speaker during the
term of their officer shall be entitled to travel at any time by railway or by air by any class within or
outside the country alongwith his family or any person accompanying him to look after and assist
him during travel and shall be entitled for the reimbursement of actual expenses so incurred on
production of tickets of such journey performed, subject to maximum of two lac rupees ineach
financial year:

Provided that the aggregate amount payable for the journey performed by railway or by
air in a financial year shall not exceed two lac rupees.

Explanation.— For the purpose of this sub-section, the expression “family” shall mean
the spouse their unmarried son(s) and daughter(s) including unmarried adopted son and daughter.

(2) The Speakerand Deputy Speaker, as the case may be, shall be entitled foran ad-
vance not exceeding rupees ten thousand on his request to undertake such journey and the
advance so paid shall be adjusted before the closing of financial year, failing which the entire
advance shall be recovered from his salary and allowances in lump-sum.

Explanation.—For determining the aggregate amount under this section, the amount so
incurred in the same financial on journey by railway or air under section 7 of the Salaries and.
Allowances of Minsters (Himachal Pradesh) Act, 2000, or under sub-section (1) of section 6 of
the Himachal Pradesh Legislative Assembly (Allowances and Pension of Members) Act, 1971
shall be taken into account. :

o gEvmer, fRo wo, Rrier—do0-Ge / 2016—6—4—2016—250 qwi® |



